Bid # 9074-072022-1

Title: Ground Maintenance -

Additional Various

Date: 7/20/2022

City Locations Time: 9:00 AM
Bid Tabulation: Preliminary Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Red Oak Outdoor Services |G. Jones Property Services, LLC Ledbetter Lawn Care, LLC Rotolo Consultants, Inc cc's Pe;f::lti:)enlll.-acwncare
Item #] Qty |Description Rate Per Cut | Yearly Total Rate Per Cut | VYearly Total Rate Per Cut | VYearly Total Rate Per Cut | VYearly Total Rate Per Cut | VYearly Total
1 1 |5TH Ave. East Traffic Circle $45.00 $2,340.00 $60.00 $3,120.00 $100.00 $5,200.00 $25.43 $1,322.36 $35.00 $1,820.00
2 1 |10th Ave. Streetscape $250.00 $13,000.00 $1,100.00 $57,200.00 no bid no bid $203.31 $10,572.12 $600.00 $31,200.00
3 1 |30th 74th Ct E Traffic Circle $45.00 $2,340.00 $85.00 $4,420.00 no bid no bid $16.56 $861.12 $35.00 $1,820.00
4 1 [Alberta Parkway $425.00 $22,100.00 $790.00 $41,080.00 no bid no bid $479.79 $24,949.08 $300.00 $15,600.00
5 1_|Circlewood Traffic Circles $55.00 $2,860.00 $130.00 $6,760.00 no bid no bid $16.45 $855.40 $50.00 $2,600.00
6 1 [College Hills Traffic Circle $50.00 $2,600.00 $60.00 $3,120.00 no bid no bid $22.29 $1,159.08 $35.00 $1,820.00
7 1 |Country Club Traffic Circles $55.00 $2,860.00 $125.00 $6,500.00 no bid no bid $31.15 $1,619.80 $35.00 $1,820.00
8 1 |Eddins Rd. Hacienda Circles $65.00 $3,380.00 $160.00 $8,320.00 no bid no bid $36.94 $1,920.88 $120.00 $6,240.00
9 1 |Fire Station 5/Admin $350.00 $18,200.00 $700.00 $36,400.00 $300.00 $15,600.00 $79.15 $4,115.80 $500.00 $26,000.00
10 1 |Greenbriar Traffic Circle $45.00 $2,340.00 $60.00 $3,120.00 no bid no bid $16.27 $846.04 $35.00 $1,820.00
11 1 |Greensboro Ave. Streetscape $325.00 $16,900.00 $1,000.00 $52,000.00 no bid no bid $270.67 $14,074.84 $600.00 $31,200.00
12 1 |Greenview Traffic Circle $45.00 $2,340.00 $65.00 $3,380.00 no bid no bid $15.82 $822.64 $35.00 $1,820.00
13 1 [Oakiidge Traffic Circle $50.00 $2,600.00 $65.00 $3,380.00 $100.00 $5,200.00 $17.21 $894.92 $35.00 $1,820.00
14 1 [Oliver Park $375.00 $19,500.00 $700.00 $36,400.00 $300.00 $15,600.00 $187.26 $9,737.52 $300.00 $15,600.00
15 1 |Orange Street Traffic Circle $50.00 $2,600.00 $90.00 $4,680.00 no bid no bid $19.96 $1,037.92 $40.00 $2,080.00
16 1 [Royal Pines Traffic Circle $45.00 $2,340.00 $80.00 $4,160.00 no bid no bid $53.08 $2,760.16 $35.00 $1,820.00
17 1 _|The Glens Traffic Circle $55.00 $2,860.00 $125.00 $6,500.00 no bid no bid $16.34 $849.68 $40.00 $2,080.00
18 1 |15"St. West Streetscape $275.00 $14,300.00 $1,400.00 $72,800.00 no bid no bid $243.19 $12,645.88 $1,200.00 $62,400.00
19 1 [3310 7TH ST. $50.00 $2,600.00 $95.00 $4,940.00 no bid no bid $26.36 $1,370.72 $40.00 $2,080.00
20 1 |Lenora Dr. Traffic Circle $50.00 $2,600.00 $85.00 $4,420.00 no bid no bid $15.49 $805.48 $35.00 $1,820.00
21 1 [2803 Colonial Dr NE $75.00 $3,900.00 $150.00 $7,800.00 no bid no bid $161.21 $8,382.92 $60.00 $3,120.00
22 1 1600 Fairmont Dr $75.00 $3,900.00 $400.00 $20,800.00 no bid no bid $42.08 $2,188.16 $70.00 $3,640.00
23 1 [2315 3rd Street East $65.00 $3,380.00 $125.00 $6,500.00 no bid no bid $16.03 $833.56 $70.00 $3,640.00
TOTAL $151,840.00 $397,800.00 $104,626.08 $223,860.00
Hourly Rate $125.00 $60.00 $100.00 $45.00 $70.00
6 years in business 2 years in business 3 yearsin ‘busmgss full tlme. and 44 years in business 20 years in business
10 years in business part time
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