»

‘_—I,'BUS‘CALOOSA Bid Tab: Auto Parts & Filters for Police Department Fleet - Bid No. 5010-101821-1
ACCOUNTING L F NCE Issue Date: 09/27/21

Open Date: 10/18/21
Primary Bid Winner
- Secondary

Vendor A Vendor B Vendor C Vendor D
O'Reilly Automotive Stores Advanced Auto Parts Northport Auto Supply NAPA Auto Partks

Bid Specs

What % is the
gEESh(A:RIPTION BID BRAND BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE local bidder above
lowest bidder?
Schedule 1 Brake Parts Does Not Qualify 1,307.14 1,354.87 1,549.56 19%
1 Brake Rotor Raybestos 580279P BrakeBest Select 580279RGS 68.79  Carquest Frontline 61251850 52.24 Raybestos 580279R 55.55 NAPA 248880279 46.89
2 Brake Rotor Raybestos 580422P BrakeBest Select 580422RGS 74.39  Carquest Frontline 61254550 68.19 Raybestos 580422R 52.95 NAPA 248880422 56.89
3 Brake Rotor Raybestos 581032P BrakeBest Select 580422RGS 74.39  Carquest Platinum YH145729P 53.29 Raybestos 581032R 51.26 NAPA 248881032 62.89
4 Brake Rotor Raybestos 680982P BrakeBest Select 680982RGS 91.99  Carquest Frontline 61559050 78.89 Raybestos 680982R 80.23 NAPA 248880982 66.89
5 Brake Rotor Raybestos 680983P Motorcraft BRRF92 100.01  Carquest Frontline 61559150 46.19 Raybestos 680983R 56.44 NAPA 248880983 42.89
6 Brake Rotor Raybestos 680507P BrakeBest Select 680507RGS 74.39  Carquest Frontline 60932850 39.04 Raybestos 680507R 52.23 NAPA 248880507 59.89
7 Brake Rotor Raybestos 680508P BrakeBest Select 680508RGS 74.39  Carquest Frontline 609290SD 75.34 Raybestos 680508R 76.35 NAPA 248880508 67.89
8 Brake Rotor Raybestos 681951PER BrakeBest Select 621767RGS 77.59  Carquest Platinum YH524200P 49.39 Raybestos 681951R 51.71 NAPA 248881951 104.89
9 Brake Rotor Raybestos 580721 BrakeBest Select 580721RGS 78.39  Carquest Frontline 61251850 52.24 Raybestos 580721R 53.78 NAPA 248880721 48.89
10 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC12031P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-B4918A 46.46 Raybestos FRC12031 42.91 NAPA SES5469CHD 78.49
11 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC12032P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-B4919A 46.46 Raybestos FRC12032 42.91 NAPA SES470CHD 78.49
12 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC11382P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-4841 51.34 Raybestos FRC11382 43.04 NAPA SES392AHD 79.89
13 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC11381P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-B4840 51.34 Raybestos FRC11381 43.04 NAPA SES391AHD 79.89
14 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC12562P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-85214 47.44 Raybestos FRC12562 50.58 NAPA SE6020AHD 79.89
15 Brake Caliper Raybestos RC12561P No Bid  Carquest Premium 18-85215 47.44 Raybestos FRC12561 50.58 NAPA SE6019AHD 79.89
16 Brake Pads Raybestos SP931PPH BrakeBes t Select SM931 43.34  Carquest Frontline FLD931P 38.99 Raybestos 44.64 NAPA 5G7834X 41.89
17 Brake Pads Raybestos SP932PPH BrakeBest Select 5C932 42.49  Carquest Frontline FLD1040 29.25 Raybestos 44.30 NAPA 5G7835X 41.89
18 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1194PPH BrakeBest Select sc1194 52.69 Carquest Frontline FLD1194 47.44 Raybestos 47.96 NAPA 5G8312X 43.89
19 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1367PPH BrakeBest Select 5C1363 46.74 Carquest Frontline FLD1363P 46.14 Raybestos 52.53 NAPA 5G8472X 5119
20 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1414PSH BrakeBest Select sC1414 52.69 Carquest Platinum PXD1414H 44.84 Raybestos 59.39 NAPA 5G8528X 5119
21 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1602TRH BrakeBest Select 5C1602 48.44 Carquest Frontline FLD1602 42.24 Raybestos 37.82 NAPA 5G8825X 5119
22 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1611APPH BrakeBest Select sC1611 54.39  Carquest Frontline FLD1611 51.99 Raybestos 52.43 NAPA 5G8855M 49.89
23 Brake Pads Raybestos SP1612PPH BrakeBest Select 5C1612 33.99  Carquest Frontline FLD1612 2079 Raybestos 40.16 NAPA 5G88255 49.89
24 Vacuum Pump Dorman 904-861 Dorman 904-861 218.69 180.17 Standard V6178 172.08 NAPA 77690941 133.99
Schedule 2 HVAC Parts Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 2,100.35 5%
25 Radiator TYC 2852 Murray 433988 195.76  Carquest Premium 433988 164.04 83.93 NAPA NR2852A 84.79
26 Radiator TvYC 2921 Mur ray 433834 22632 Carquest Premium 432298 181.04 130.29 NAPA NR24238 114.35
27 Radiator TvYC 13226 Murray 8013226 170.93  Carquest Premium 813225 142.79 143.07 NAPA CU13226 132.89
28 Radiator TvYC 13510 Murray 8013510 32851  Carquest Premium 813510 21079 146.11 NAPA CU13510 133.89
29 Condenser TvYC 3557 Murray 7-3557 138.66  Carquest Premium 1148 127.49 68.12 NAPA NC35578 85.89
30 Condenser TvYC 4283 AC Delco 84621302 Special Order  Carquest Premium 814283 129.19 93.63 NAPA NC4283A 123.85
31 Condenser TvYC 3788 Mur ray 7-3788 17648 Carquest Premium 713788 133.44 60.43 NAPA NC37888 109.84
32 Condenser TvYC 4689 Motorcraft 658 Special Order  Carquest Premium 813229 180.19 85.96 NAPA NC4689A 104.71
33 Condenser AC Delco 15-63666 Murray 7-4953 129.61 GM Genuine Parts 15-63666 150.82 TYC 4953 43.48 NAPA NC4953A 104.89
34 Condenser AC Delco 15-63787 Mur ray 7-4283 159.60 Worldpac/AC Delco  R10301330215ACD 156.60 TvC 4283 93.63 NAPA NC4283A 104.89
35 Condenser Motorcraft DG12-19712-B Motorcraft Y568 Special Order  Carquest Premium 714435 169.99 4-Seasons 41072 116.25 NAPA NC4435A 129.05
36 Condenser Motorcraft HI32-19712-A NoBid  Carquest Premium 714689 127.49 TvC 4689 85.96 NAPA NC4689A 104.71
37 Compressor Motorcraft DA82-19703-C Murray 197358 303.44  Carquest Premium T198358 321.89 4-Seasons 197358 232.35 NAPA 276464 21538
38 Compressor Motorcraft HL32-19703-C Murray 58664 564.89 No Bid 4-Seasons 58664 446.68 MC HL3Z-19703-C 365.00
39 Compressor AC Delco 15-22303 AC Delco 15-22303 260.95 AC Delco R10001878808ACD 380.57 4-Seasons 198333 251.25 GM 1522303 275.99
40 Compressor AC Delco 15-51267 AC Delco 15-51267 24.85  ACDelco/ACSensor | R1070602120ACD 2853 19.21  DELCO (TEMP SENSOR) 15-51267 1871
Schedule 3 Fuel System Parts Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 1,492.10 10%
41 Fuel pump AC Delco M100095 AC Delco M100095 Special Order|  Carquest Premium M2496229 214.19 Auto Best F2770A 117.80 NAPA €0290M 224.91
42 Fuel pump AC Delco M1000235 NoBid  Carquest Premium 2496038 50.14 Carter P77336M 255.98 AC DELCO M100235 235.00
43 Fuel pump AC Delco HPM1035 Standard Ignition GDP105 333.86  GM Genuine Parts HPM1035 22524 Standard GDP105 245.17 NAPA 234109 207.39
44 Fuel pump Motorcraft BW1Z-9H307A Precision A43030 314.95  Carquest Premium HS3496153 217.59 Carter P765965 161.02 NAPA HP10199 264.80
45 Fuel pump Motorcraft FL32-9A299C No Bid Motorcraft E3001663744MTR 392.79 Motorcraft P5968 118.69 MC FL3Z-9A299C 42.52
46 Fuel pump Motorcraft FL3Z-9H307A Delphi FG1990 Special Order Delphi FG1990 226.09 119.00 MC FL3Z-9H307A 139.74
47 Fuel pump Motorcraft DG12-9H307P Delphi FG1656 Special Order Delphi FG1656 305.99 Carter P77112M 180.09 NAPA FG1656 279.40
48 Fuel pump Motorcraft JL32-9H307G No Bid No Bid Delphi FG2326 189.62 MC JL3Z-9H307G 169.20
49 Fuel Pipe AC Delco 12677002 No Bid No Bid AC Delco 12677002 76.29 M 12677002 45.90
50  Fuel Pipe AC Delco 12677004 Standard Ignition GDL109 42.16  GM Genuine Parts 12677004 33.99 Standard GDL109 28.44 NAPA 234414 27.03
Schedule 4 Suspension & Chassis Parts 2,445.51 2,114.32 1,845.43
51 Control Arm AC Delco 84628487 Precision 4CB50560 139.43 Moog RK623125 53.02 Moog RK100214 188.64 NAPA/NCP 2608237 131.97
52 Control Arm AC Delco 84628488 Precision 4CB50561 139.43 Moog RK623126 53.02 Moog RK100215 188.64 NAPA/NCP 2608236 131.97
53 Swaybar End Link TRW JTS1156 MasterPro K8772 12.69 TRW 11029577124ACD 8.48 1024 NAPA/NCP 2651206 15.78
54 Chassis Part Moog RK620218 Precision 12CB40050 182.41 157.69 TRW JTC2020 164.08 NAPA/NCP 2605262 159.71
55 Chassis Part Moog RK620219 Precision 12CB40051 182.41 157.69 TRW JTC2030 164.08 NAPA/NCP 2605261 159.71
56 Chassis Part Moog CK80038 Precision 3CB40036 87.86 79.67 TRW JTC1525 49.24 NAPA/NCP 2605221 45.99
57 Chassis Part Moog CK80040 Precision 3CB40037 87.86 79.67 TRW JTC1522 49.24 NAPA/NCP 2605222 45.99
58 Chassis Part Moog EV4S5 MasterPro EV455 46.26 44.39 TRW JAR1224 28.82 NAPA/NCP ES3673 2438
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City of
TUSCALOOSA
ACCOUNT G AF HNCE

Primary Bid Winner

- Secondary

Bid Specs

ITEM
DESCRIPTION
59 Chassis Part Moog
60 Chassis Part Moog
61 Chassis Part Moog
62 Chassis Part Moog
63 Chassis Part Moog
64 Chassis Part Moog
65 Chassis Part Moog
66 Chassis Part Moog
67 Chassis Part Moog
68 Chassis Part Moog
69 Chassis Part Moog
70 Chassis Part Moog
71 Chassis Part Moog
72 Chassis Part Moog
73 Chassis Part Moog
74 Chassis Part Moog
75 Chassis Part Moog
76 Chassis Part Moog
Schedule 5 Hub Bearings
77 Hub Bearing SKF
78 Hub Bearing SKF
79 Hub Bearing SKF
80  Hub Bearing SKF
81 Hub Bearing SKF
Schedule 6 Engine Mounts
82 Engine Mount Anchor
83 Engine Mount Anchor
84 Engine Mount Anchor
85 Engine Mount Anchor
86 Engine Mount Anchor
87 Engine Mount Anchor
88 Engine Mount Anchor
89 Engine Mount Anchor
90 Engine Mount Anchor
91 Engine Mount Anchor
Schedule 7 Body Parts
92 Body Part Dorman
93 Body Part Dorman
94 Body Part Dorman
95 Body Part Dorman
96 Body Part Dorman
97 Body Part Dorman
98 Body Part Dorman
99  Body Part Dorman
100  Body Part Dorman
101 Body Part Dorman
102 Body Part Dorman
103 Body Part Dorman
104  Body Part Dorman
105  Body Part Dorman
106  Body Part Dorman
107  Body Part Dorman
108  Body Part Dorman
109  Body Part TYC
110 Body Part TYC
111 Body Part TYC
112 Body Part TYC
113 Body Part TYC
114  Body Part TYC
Schedule 8 Ignition Parts
115 Ignition AC Delco
116 Ignition AC Delco
117 Ignition AC Delco

ES3693
ES3694
K200168
RK641799
RK641800
CK620955
CK620956
CK80669
CK80670
K200222
ES800621
CK80306
CK80308
RK621266
RK621267
ES800514
ES800515
EV800457

BR930506
BR930693
BR930742
BR930790
BR930915

3024
3025
3180
3211
3218
3219
3275
3276
3371
3372

741-390
741-391
741-442
741-443
741-664
741-665
741-678
741-679
751-224
751-225
751775
931-140
931-300
931-301
931-305
931-332
931-333
11-6787-00-9
11-6788-00-9
20-5233-90
20-5234-90
20-6755-00
20-6756-00

41-110
41-114
41-810

BID BRAND

MasterPro
MasterPro
MasterPro
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
MasterPro
MasterPro
MasterPro

Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision
Precision

PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque
PowerTorque

Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman

Standard Ignition
Dorman

TYC
TYC
TYC
TYC

AC Delco
AC Delco
AC Delco

Vendor A
O'Reilly Automotive Stores

BID UNIT PRICE

ES3693 38.10
ES3694 42.63
K200168 10.39
13CB40104 73.52
1CB40105 59.20
11CB50099 141.34
11CB50098 141.34
4CB50010 165.21
4CB50011 165.21
K200222 7.21
ES800621 38.51
8CB40098 109.81
8CB40099 109.81
11CB40163 149.94
11CB40162 149.94
£5800514 64.41
ES800515 64.41
EV800457 36.18
920.85
513230 111.02
515097 218.64
513275 184.47
550219 193.19
515159 213.53
601.33
83024 44.11
83025 57.93
83180 8535
3211 42.85
83218 32.46
A3219 62.45
5739 65.75
5739 65.75
5730 62.45
85804 82.23
Does Not Qualify
741-390 78.30
741-391 7353
741-442 75.20
741-443 81.17
741-664 7162
741-665 76.39
741-678 82.12
741-679 82.12
751-224 95.49
751-225 Special Order
751775 84.11
931-140 185.72
931-300 180.75
931-301 114.21
931-305 189.08
DLA675 22155
931-333 198.63
No Bid
No Bid
20-5233-90 46.92
20-5234-90 46.92
20-6755-00 101.67
20-6756-00 101.67
583.77
41-110 8.99
41114 8.99
41-810 7.89

BID BRAND

Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium

Carquest Premium

Moog
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium

No Bid
No Bid
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman
Dorman

Vendor B
Advanced Auto Parts

BID PART NO.

810-2585918
810-2585908

310-258601

513230
94-258034
91-285209
94-480983
94-545855

1590151
1590152
1591943
1591944

Bid Tab: Auto Parts & Filters for Police Department Fleet - Bid No. 5010-101821-1
Issue Date: 09/27/21
Open Date: 10/18/21

cal Bidder

Vendor D
NAPA Auto Partks

Vendor C
Northport Auto Supply

BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE
43.65 TRW JTE1331 36.11 NAPA/NCP ES3693 29.99
44.39 TRW JTE1351 36.11 NAPA/NCP ES3964 29.99
14.42 TRW 1BU1114 11.46 NAPA/NCP 2652669 11.73
48.13 TRW JTC2644 36.44 NAPA/NCP 2606229 35.93
47.30 TRW JTC2643 29.00 NAPA/NCP 2606224 27.99

188.40 TRW JTC1974 143.48 NAPA/NCP 2606065 129.00
188.40 TRW JTC1950 143.48 NAPA/NCP 2606064 129.00
146.07 TRW JTC1509 84.38 NAPA/NCP 2605507 84.99
146.07 TRW JTC1510 84.38 NAPA/NCP 2605508 84.99
7.61 TRW 1BU1285 5.79 NAPA/NCP 2652748 5.98
39.21 TRW ITE1637 35.22 NAPA/NCP 1693770 29.49
68.05 TRW JTC1580 72.46 NAPA/NCP 2605243 66.54
68.05 TRW JTC1581 72.46 NAPA/NCP 2605244 66.54
124.49 164.20 NAPA/NCP 2606608 119.89
124.49 164.20 NAPA/NCP 2606609 119.89
88.79 TRW ITE374 60.64 NAPA/NCP 2693525 67.05
45.87 TRW ITE375 60.64 NAPA/NCP 2693524 67.05
32.55 TRW JAR1182 30.89 NAPA/NCP 2693656 23.89
99.53 81.26 CR 930506 72.90
147.45 168.80 CR 930693 129.18
143.80 BCA WEB0539 98.98 CR 930742 109.89
162.05 BCA WEB1185 126.96 CR 930790 119.89
160.59 BCA WEB1846 153.43 CR 930915 152.20
728.32 367.22 607.66
67.07 28.73 NAPA/BK 6022219 48.65
66.21 28.73 NAPA/BK 6022220 48.65
81.69 45.63 NAPA/BK 6022595 78.89
77.39 25.81 NAPA/BK 6022708 52.79
29.23 20.08 NAPA/BK 6022728 39.40
56.75 36.23 NAPA/BK 6022729 58.90
110.93 42.40 NAPA/BK 6022941 85.40
119.53 42.00 NAPA/BK 6022942 85.40
51.59 45.05 NAPA/BK 3371 49.79
67.93 52.56 NAPA/BK 3372 59.79
Does Not Qualify 1,668.33
80.03 ACl 82222 62.17 NAPA/NOE 6654332 59.79
82,64 ACl 82223 62.17 NAPA/NOE 6654333 59.79
69.59 ACl 82238 60.58 NAPA/NOE 6652469 58.26
74.81 ACI 82239 60.58 NAPA/NOE 6652470 58.26
65.24 ACl 83184 54.60 NAPA/NOE 6654773 59.90
74.81 ACI 83185 54.60 NAPA/NOE 6654774 59.90
104.39 ACI 83149 54.60 NAPA/NOE 6654488 62.37
99.17 ACI 83148 54.60 NAPA/NOE 6654775 62.37
13571 ACl 383436 97.50 NAPA/NOE 66569561 79.45
135.71 ACI 383437 109.04 NAPA/NOE 66569571 79.45
120.92 ACl 383358 74.44 NAPA/NOE 66575471 79.00
162.68 STANDARD DLA347 142.91 NAPA/NOE 65581401 141.44
156.59 STANDARD DLA980 123.03 NAPA/NOE 7701597 23.65
100.04 STANDARD DLA723 80.60 NAPA/NOE 7707821 24.65
150.50 STANDARD DLAG8O 114.59 NAPA/NOE 6558305 139.02
204.44 STANDARD DLA675 42.77 NAPA/NOE 6558332 168.89
173.99 102.27 NAPA/NOE 6558333 119.45
56.00 TvC 11-6787-00-9 69.80
56.00 TvC 11-6788-00-9 69.80
59.79 31.09 TYC 20-5233-90 41.20
57.03 31.09 TYC 20-5234-90 41.20
129.62 71.55 NAPA/NOE 8214599 88.20
129.62 71.55 NAPA/NOE 8214598 88.20
588.39 306.22
8.09 8.23 AC 41-110 6.49
8.09 8.23 AC 41-114 6.49
7.10 6.68 AC 41-810 5.45

What % is the
local bidder above
lowest bidder?

65%

57%
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City of
TUSCALOOSA
ACCOUNT G AF HNCE

Primary Bid Winner

- Secondary

Bid Specs

ITEM

DESCRIPTION
118 Ignition AC Delco
119 Ignition AC Delco
120 Ignition AC Delco
121 Ignition Denso
122 Ignition Denso
123 Ignition Denso
124 Ignition Denso
125 Ignition Denso
126 Ignition Denso
127 Ignition Denso

Schedule 9 Belts & Tensioners
128 Belt Gates
129 Belt Gates
130 Belt Gates
131 Belt Gates
132 Belt Gates
133 Belt Gates
134 Belt Gates
135 Belt Gates
136 Belt Gates
137 Belt Gates
138 Belt Gates
139 Belt Tensioner Gates
140 Belt Tensioner Gates
141 Belt Tensioner Gates
142 Belt Tensioner Gates
143 Belt Tensioner Gates
144 Belt Tensioner Gates

Cooling System

Schedule 10 Parts
145 Water Pump Gates
146 Water Pump Gates
147 Water Pump Gates
148 Water Pump Gates
149 Water Pump Gates
150  Water Pump Gates
151 Water Pump Gates
152 Hose Gates
153 Hose Gates
154 Hose Gates
155 Hose Gates
156 Hose Gates
157 Hose Gates
158 Hose Gates
159 Hose Gates
160 Hose Gates
161 Hose Gates
162 Hose Gates
163 Reservoir Tank Dorman
164 Radiator TvC

Schedule 11 Wipers
165 Wiper Blade Trico
166 Wiper Blade Trico
167 Wiper Blade Trico
168 Wiper Blade Trico
169 Wiper Blade Trico
170 Wiper Blade Trico
171 Wiper Blade Trico
172 Wiper Blade Trico
173 Wiper Blade Trico
174 Wiper Blade Trico

Schedule 12 Filters
175 Filter Baldwin
176 Filter Baldwin

41-814

748UV

9718Q

673-6000
673-6013
673-6300
673-6303
673-6304
673-7002
673-7104

k040533
k060448
k060535
k060640
k060714
k060910
k060923
k060935
K030293SF
K040337SF
K040357SF
38485
39083
39298
39299
39364
39371

41118
42586
43016
43318
43504
42200
45010
22437
23184
23544
23643
24338
24342
24381
24409
24418
24423
24451
603-973
13397

BID BRAND

AC Delco

AC Delco

AC Delco

MasterPro
Standard Ignition
Standard Ignition
Standard Ignition
Standard Ignition
Standard Ignition
Standard Ignition

Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates

Murray
Murray
Murray
Murray
Murray
Gates
Murray
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Gates
Dorman
Murray

Trico
Trico
Trico
Trico
Trico
Trico
Trico
Bosch
Trico
Trico

WIX
WIX

Vendor A
O'Reilly Automotive Stores

BID UNIT PRICE

41-814 7.99
74800 73.34
9718Q 75.72
2-50006 31.83
UF553 69.85
UF646 65.31
UF612 77.11
UF622 51.71
UFa13 53.33
UFa14 51.71
569.20
K040533 8.70
K060448 19.30
K060535 21.44
K060640 22.86
K060714 19.95
K060910 26.40
K060923 33.28
K060935 26.78
K030293SF 43.11
K040337SF 26.78
K040357SF 17.23
38485 64.73
39083 44.66
39298 70.04
39299 55.22
39364 31.82
39371 36.90
Does Not Qualify
CPa128 41.99
CP6020 61.38
CP6741 71.20
CP6348 2615
CP4130 33.84
42200 Special Order
CP6009 150.23
22437 23.04
23184 35.59
23544 30.45
23643 14.19
24338 71.08
24342 22.39
24381 27.70
24409 41.89
24418 44.68
24423 64.51
24451 64.10
603-973 44.90
8013397 287.92
101.86
25-140 20.50
29-150 9.99
29-160 9.99
29-180 9.99
29-200 9.99
29-220 9.99
29-260 9.99
RI218 8.85
31-130 3.59
16) 8.98
104.38
51515 439
51061 5.50

BID BRAND

Carquest

Carquest

Carquest
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premuim
Carquest Premium

Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Litens
Litens
Dayco
Dayco
Litens
Litens

Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco
Dayco

Carquest Premium

Trico NeoForm
Trico
Trico Flex
Bosch
Trico Flex
Bosch
Trico Flex

Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium

Vendor B
Advanced Auto Parts

BID PART NO.

EBC1342
26C1022
EBC1011
EBC1091
EBC1031
EBC1789
EBC1787

5040535
5060450
5060535
5060640
5060715
5060910
5060923
5060935
E030296
E040340
4PK932EE
999419A
900027A
89631
89698
999846A
999545A

T1238
T1205
T3160
T2327
T4196
T4285
T7053
E71990
E72376
E72489
E72639
E72776
E72775
E72489
E72730
E72639
E73073
5060755

813398

85515
85060HD

Bid Tab: Auto Parts & Filters for Police Department Fleet - Bid No. 5010-101821-1
Issue Date: 09/27/21
Open Date: 10/18/21

cal Bidder

Vendor D
NAPA Auto Partks

Vendor C
Northport Auto Supply

BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE BID BRAND BID PART NO. BID UNIT PRICE
6.68 AC 41-814 5.45

Denso 671.8063 39.41 NAPA 3147 59.95

STANDARD 27862 33.00 NAPA 3137 39.89

10.59 NAPA 1C36958 23.99

37.18 NAPA 1C63358 63.43

34.17 NAPA 1C74958 54.80

33.14 NAPA IC715 49.78

27.83 NAPA IC725 49.78

30.73 NAPA 1C53358 58.20

30.35 NAPA 1C53458 57.20

449.40

NBH/GATES 25040533 6.59

NBH/GATES 25060448 1217

NBH/GATES 25060535 15.02

NBH/GATES 25060640 15.97

NBH/GATES 25060714 13.93

NBH/GATES 25060910 20.34

NBH/GATES 25060923 23.22

NBH/GATES 25060935 19.28

NBH/GATES 25030293SF 31.18

X NBH/GATES 25040337SF 33.45
16.07 NBH/GATES 25040357SF 12.07
53.89 NBH/GATES 66010591 48.15
14.62 NBH/GATES 39083 45.01
70.83 NBH/GATES 39298 54.74
63.90 NBH/GATES 39299 43.12
31.95 NBH/GATES 39364 26.42
33.87 NBH/GATES 39371 28.74
1,234.82 831.60
44.19 GMB 125-5970 27.56 TFW/GATES 1118 27.71
66.29 GMB 130-9660 44.36 TFW/GATES 42586 35.37
101.14 45.22 TFW/GATES 43016 39.70
114.74 31.96 TFW/GATES 43318 39.31
35.69 29.46 TFW/GATES 43504 27.09
81.59 63.83 TFW/GATES 42200 53.79
159.79 GMB 130-9670 120.24 TFW/GATES 45010 99.55
20.09 17.15 NBH/GATES 9070 18.89
30.35 28.17 NBH/GATES 9867 32.89
25.11 24.49 NBH/GATES 16268 23.99
12.72 12.41 NBH/GATES 16339 11.89
64.98 61.51 NBH/GATES 17004 56.28
21.77 17.76 NBH/GATES 17008 17.50
25.11 24.21 NBH/GATES 17047 22.22
42.87 34.86 NBH/GATES 17075 32.89
12.72 30.53 NBH/GATES 17084 28.98
93.12 43.96 NBH/GATES 17089 39.99
19.42 50.36 NBH/GATES 17105 43.98
42.99 45.15 NOE 60503581 38.79
220.14 143.48 TYC 13397 140.79
14.06 5.61 NAPA NP14 3.79
8.70 5.61 NAPA NP15 3.79
12.05 5.61 NAPA NP16 3.79
6.55 5.61 NAPA NP18 3.79
13.39 5.61 NAPA NP20 3.79
8.70 5.61 NAPA NP22 3.79
13.39 6.85 NAPA NP26 4.99
8.70 5.07 NAPA NP12 3.59
8.70 4.19 NAPA NP13 3.59
8.70 5.07 NAPA NP16 3.59
3.14 2.74 NAPA 1515MP 2.46
3.49 3.12 NAPA 1061MP 2.46

What % is the
local bidder above
lowest bidder?
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City of
TUSCALOOSA
Ae

BUHTING & FINANCE

Primary Bid Winner

-Secnndary

Bid Specs

ITEM

DESCRIPTION
177 Filter Baldwin
178 Filter Baldwin
179 Filter Baldwin
180 Filter Baldwin
181 Filter Baldwin
182 Filter Baldwin
183 Filter Baldwin
184 Filter Baldwin
185 Filter Baldwin
186 Filter Baldwin
187 Filter Baldwin
188 Filter Baldwin

B31
B34
B160
B329
P7406
87449
PA2152
PA4113
PA4321
PA4322
PA4323
BF7668

BID BRAND

WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WIX
WX

Vendor A
O'Reilly Automotive Stores

51042
51085
57060
51372
57041
57502
46134
42487
46935
49010
49883
33595

BID UNIT PRICE

439
439
439
439
439
439
6.59
13.19
9.89
17.59
13.19
7.70

BID BRAND

Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium
Carquest Premium

Vendor B
Advanced Auto Parts

85042
85038
84060
85372
84041
84502
88134
87487
88935
83010
83883
86595

Bid Tab: Auto Parts & Filters for Police Department Fleet - Bid No. 5010-101821-1

BID UNIT PRICE

3.14
4.54
3.14
3.14
3.14
3.14
4.54

6.29
1224

3.67

BID UNIT PRICE

3.14
2.79
278
3.00
2.93
3.08
4.16
8.68
5.60
10.94
8.28
4.66

Vendor D
NAPA Auto Partks

BID BRAND

NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA
NAPA

1042MP
1085MP
7060MP
1372MP
7041
7502MP
6134
2487
6935
9010
9883
3595MP

Issue Date: 09/27/21
Open Date: 10/18/21

BID UNIT PRICE

2.46
2.46
2.46
2.46
2.59
2.46
3.88
7.77
5.83
10.36
7.77
3.14

What % is the
local bidder above
lowest bidder?
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