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City of

TUSCALOOSA

ACCOUNTING & FINANCE

Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1

Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

- . . upply Co Inc - Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
Preliminary Bid Tabulation e S. [)p v A Core & Main LP Empire Pipe ¥ 2 4
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
Il;me Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

em
Schedule 1 Copper & Brass Pipe

1 3/4" COPPER PIPE TYPE K SOFT 5.78 No Bid 15.12 6.95 5.32 6.24

2 1" COPPER PIPE TYPE K SOFT 7.65 No Bid 19.17 9.40 6.96 7.78

3 2" RED BRASS PIPE (SEAMLESS) (12 FT. LONG) 39.96 No Bid 50.08 28.00 43.30 34.00
Schedule 1 Total 53.39 Does Not Qualify 84.37 44.35 55.58 48.02
Schedule 2 Ductile Iron Pipe

4 4" CLASS 350 - D. I. PIPE 27.71 No Bid 27.01 23.40 25.66 27.36

5 6" CLASS 350 - D. I. PIPE 21.12 No Bid 20.59 17.90 18.21 20.93

6 8" CLASS 350 - D. I. PIPE 27.81 No Bid 27.11 23.56 24.01 27.55

7 12" CLASS 350 - D. I. PIPE 42.62 No Bid 41.54 36.05 36.93 42.21

8 24" CLASS 250 - D. I. PIPE 112.22 No Bid 109.38 109.30 103.91 123.44
Schedule 2 Total 231.48 Does Not Qualify 225.63 210.21 208.72 241.49
Schedule 3 HDPE Pipe

9 15" HDPE PIPE 12.11 No Bid 12.24 12.12 10.61 12.24

10 18" HDPE PIPE 15.12 No Bid 15.83 15.67 13.53 15.83

11 24" HDPE PIPE 25.52 No Bid 28.49 28.20 23.49 28.00

12 30" HDPE PIPE 40.22 No Bid 40.44 40.03 33.45 39.00

13 36" HDPEPIPE 48.22 No Bid 50.02 49.50 44.95 49.00
Schedule 3 Total 141.19 Does Not Qualify 147.02 145.52 126.03 144.07
Schedule 4 Galvanized Pipe

14 3/4" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. Long ) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.45 2.42 No Bid

15 1" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.35 3.45 No Bid

16 11/2" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.95 5.28 No Bid

17 2" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.00 6.98 No Bid
Schedule 4 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 16.75 18.13 Does Not Qualify
Schedule 5 Fire Hydrants and Accessories

18  FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) 1,678.00 1,700.00 1,639.69 1,654.00 1,517.35 1,502.33

19 FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) M. J. 3 FT 6 IN BURY 1,710.00 1,740.00 1,671.31 1,685.00 1,528.98 1,531.04

20  FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) 1,742.00 1,780.00 1,703.32 1,717.00 1,559.87 1,560.74

21 FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) 1,806.00 1,865.00 1,767.35 1,750.00 1,678.99 1,618.65
Schedule 5 Total 6,936.00 7,085.00 6,781.67 6,806.00 6,285.19 6,212.76
Schedule 6 Manhole Rings, Covers, Risers and Accessories

22 MANHOLE RING, STANDARD V1344 No Bid No Bid 218.76 225.00 162.50 209.00

23 MANHOLE COVER, LOGO STANDARD AND LOW PROFILE (V1344-1) No Bid No Bid 125.06 150.00 112.99 117.34

24 MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING 3" No Bid No Bid 54.29 No Bid 32.00 45.00

25 MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING 4" No Bid No Bid 62.86 No Bid 43.00 50.00

26 MANHOLE ECCENTRIC CONE TOP 48" X 36" No Bid No Bid 508.57 No Bid 385.00 416.67

27 MANHOLE BAR (KEN-TOOL#33223) No Bid No Bid 46.43 No Bid 34.50 35.00

28 1" ORLANDO RISER RING (23-2-1) No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid 98.99 88.00
Schedule 6 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 1,165.97 Does Not Qualify 868.98 961.01
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City of
TUSCALOOSA

ACCOUNTING & FINANCE

Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1

Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co.lnc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
:;2‘:" Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Schedule 7 Meter Accessories
29 3/4" COMP X FIP CURB STOP MCDONALD 6102WT OR EQUAL 61.38 No Bid 50.81 59.46 48.27 54.00
30  3/4" COPPER FLARE X F.I.P. CURB STOPS MCDONALD 76102W OR EQUAL 64.12 No Bid 51.95 62.06 50.43 50.94
31 3/4"FIP X FIP CURB STOP MCDONALD 6101W OR EQUAL 54.56 No Bid 45.17 52.85 42.91 44.00
32 1" COMP X FIP CURB STOPS MCDONALD 6102WT OR EQUAL 93.11 No Bid 77.07 90.15 73.22 77.00
33  1"FIP X FIP CURB STOPS MCDONALD 6101W OR EQUAL 83.64 No Bid 69.23 80.95 65.77 55.00
34  2"FIP X FIP CURB STOP MCDONALD 6101W OR EQUAL 246.00 No Bid 203.78 240.15 193.59 200.00
35  3/4" CORPORATION STOPS MCDONALD 74701BT OR EQUAL 49.29 No Bid 42.32 46.12 40.20 42.40
36 1" CORPORATION STOPS MCDONALD 4701T OR EQUAL 64.82 No Bid 55.64 60.67 52.86 53.97
37  3/4"METER COUPLINGS 1 1/2" LONG 11.82 No Bid 9.67 18.30 9.19 9.00
38  3/4" METER COUPLINGS 2" LONG 10.40 No Bid 8.52 12.00 8.09 10.00
39  3/4"METER COUPLINGS 2 1/2" LONG 10.40 No Bid 8.52 9.00 8.09 8.00
40  3/4" METER COUPLING 2 3/4" LONG 11.58 No Bid 9.48 22.00 9.01 8.00
41 1" METER COUPLINGS 2 1/2" LONG 16.02 No Bid 13.11 35.00 12.45 11.50
42 1" METER COUPLINGS 1 1/2" LONG 15.56 No Bid 12.74 18.00 12.10 11.50
43 3/4" X 1/8" RUBBER METER WASHER 0.10 No Bid 0.10 0.08 0.10 0.07
44 3/4"X 1/16" RUBBER METER WASHER 0.10 No Bid 0.09 0.07 0.09 0.07
45 3/4" X 1/32" RUBBER METER WASHER 0.10 No Bid 0.07 0.07 0.09 0.07
46 1" X 1/8 RUBBER METER WASHER 0.12 No Bid 0.11 0.09 0.10 0.10
47  1"X1/16 RUBBER METER WASHER 0.12 No Bid 0.10 0.09 0.09 0.10
48  3/4"X1/16" FIBER METER WASHER 0.11 No Bid 0.09 0.07 0.09 0.07
49  3/4"X1/32" FIBER METER WASHER 0.11 No Bid 0.07 0.07 0.08 0.07
50 1"X1/16" FIBER METER WASHER 0.12 No Bid 0.11 0.09 0.10 0.10
51  1"X1/32" FIBER METER WASHER 0.12 No Bid 0.09 0.08 0.09 0.10
52  2'X3'X30"METER VAULT No Bid No Bid 1,180.18 1,275.00 1,224.01 1,032.85
53 3 X5X36" METER VAULT No Bid No Bid 1,523.45 1,650.00 1,579.08 2,490.99
54  4X6X48" METER VAULT (927 LB BODY,391 LB FOR LIDS) No Bid No Bid 2,952.04 2,800.00 2,649.07 3,611.58
55  STANDARD PLASTIC METER BOX (10"X15"X10") (BOX ONLY) No Bid No Bid 15.36 16.00 11.00 11.00
56  STANDARD METER BOX LID (SOLID) LC-528 No Bid No Bid 17.14 18.00 13.00 12.75
57  STANDARD METER BOX LID (WITH 2" HOLE) LC-528T No Bid No Bid 17.14 18.00 13.01 12.75
58  STANDARD PLASTIC METER BOX LID (WITH 2" HOLE) D1200-DITRL No Bid No Bid 14.29 15.00 11.01 10.60
59  JUMBO PLASTIC METER BOX (13"X20"X12") (BOX ONLY) No Bid No Bid 31.43 29.00 23.00 23.00
60 JUMBO METER BOX LID (SOLID) LC-2115 No Bid No Bid 48.57 46.00 35.00 34.50
61  JUMBO METER BOX LID (WITH 2" HOLE) LC-2115T No Bid No Bid 45.71 44.00 33.00 34.00
62  JUMBO PLASTIC METER BOX LID (WITH 2" HOLE) D1500-DISBTRLD No Bid No Bid 24.96 125.00 96.48 15.00
63  MSP STANDARD 11" X 18" X 12" METER BOX & LID No Bid No Bid 113.33 195.00 186.93 155.51
64  MSPJUMBO 13" X 24" X 12" METER BOX & LID No Bid No Bid 166.70 135.00 128.97 212.42
65  3/4" WILKINS #700 (FIP X FIP) BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 30.57 23.30 21.40 24.00
66 1" WILKINS #700 (FIP X FIP) BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 34.09 26.30 23.86 24.47
67  11/2"BACKFLOW PREVENTER( WATTS 007QT 16 3/4" LONG) No Bid No Bid 434.21 338.00 303.95 285.00
68 2" WILKINS #950 BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL (19 1/2" LONG) No Bid No Bid 507.50 398.00 355.25 364.36
69 2" BRONZE METER FLANGES WITH BOLTS & GASKETS 69.00 No Bid 90.64 72.00 65.99 44.00
70  11/2" BRONZE METER FLANGES WITH BOLTS & GASKETS 64.00 No Bid 75.69 62.00 54.55 43.00
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Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
II;:‘:\ Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
71 1-1/2" FULL FACE METER GASKET 1.17 No Bid 1.50 1.00 1.25 0.70
72 2" FULL FACE METER GASKET 1.34 No Bid 1.26 1.25 1.02 1.00
73  HAND PUMP (METER BOX) 38.00 No Bid 60.39 48.00 26.50 31.00
Schedule 7 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 8,044.99 8,143.27 7,484.34 9,110.54
Schedule 8 Water Meters
Meters with Standard Cable
74 3/4" SHORT ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75  3/4" ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 1" ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 164.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77 11/2" RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS, CU. FT. No Bid 448.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78  11/2" COMPOUND WATER METER, CU. FT. (13" long) No Bid 1,129.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 2" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (15 1/4" long) No Bid 1,374.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 2" RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS, CU. FT. No Bid 620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81 3" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (17" long) No Bid 1,641.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 4" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (20" long) No Bid 2,707.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Meters with ITRON Cable
83  3/4" SHORT ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 141.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84  3/4" ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 1" ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METER No Bid 189.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
86  11/2"RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS, CU. FT. No Bid 490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87  11/2"COMPOUND WATER METER, CU. FT. (13" long) No Bid 1,189.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 2" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (15 1/4" long) No Bid 1,431.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 2" RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS, CU. FT. No Bid 639.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 3" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (17" long) No Bid 1,692.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 4" COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (20" long) No Bid 2,760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
92 6” COMPOUND WATER METERS, CU. FT. (24” long) No Bid 4,825.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Meter
93 SENSUS OMNI H2 HYDRANT METER, H3X2HX1FXAXX1ND - OR EQUAL No Bid 2,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 8 Total Does Not Qualify 23,992.00 Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify
Schedule 9 2” and Smaller Pipe Accessories
94 1/2" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES 2.16 No Bid 2.43 2.15 1.65 1.69
95 1/2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES 3.95 No Bid 4.43 3.90 3.02 3.09
96 1/2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES 5.42 No Bid 6.46 5.65 4.39 4.49
97  3/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 2.16 No Bid 2.57 2.25 1.75 1.79
98  3/4" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES 2.71 No Bid 3.24 2.85 2.21 2.26
99  3/4" X4" BRASS NIPPLES 4.73 No Bid 5.66 4.95 3.85 3.93
100 3/4" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES 6.94 No Bid 8.26 7.25 5.63 5.74
101 1" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 3.17 No Bid 3.80 3.35 2.58 2.64
102 1" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES 3.94 No Bid 4.69 4.15 3.18 3.26
103 1" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES 6.85 No Bid 8.19 7.20 5.57 5.70
104 1" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES 10.12 No Bid 12.06 10.60 8.22 8.39
105 11/2" X 12" BRASS NIPPLES 31.40 No Bid 41.64 36.50 28.10 26.50
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Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks

Line . . . . . . . . . q q n q

- Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

106 2" X2 1/2" BRASS NIPPLES 11.82 No Bid 12.24 10.75 8.33 8.00
107 2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES 15.46 No Bid 18.49 16.25 12.47 12.19
108 2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES 22.83 No Bid 27.29 23.90 18.39 18.00
109 2" X 8" BRASS NIPPLES 29.23 No Bid 36.40 32.00 24.56 24.01
110 2" X 12" BRASS NIPPLES 43.18 No Bid 53.77 47.25 36.29 35.45
111 3/4" BRASS HAYSTITE NUT (CAMBRIDGE BRASS 81-J3) No Bid No Bid 15.04 13.00 10.65 10.00
112 1" BRASS HAYSTITE NUT (CAMBRIDGE BRASS 81-J4) No Bid No Bid 18.44 18.00 12.99 12.50
113 2" UNIFLANGE 1300-S ( RESTRAINT DEVICE ) 22.00 No Bid 23.44 24.00 18.75 21.20
114 3/4"X 3 1/2" LONG T-HEAD BOLT WITH HEAVY HEX NUT 1.75 No Bid 2.11 2.35 4.55 2.06
115  3/4" X 4" LONG T-HEAD BOLT WITH HEAVY HEX NUT 1.75 No Bid 2.11 2.35 4.56 2.20
116  3/4" X4 1/2" LONG T-HEAD BOLT WITH HEAVY HEX NUT 1.98 No Bid 2.35 2.65 4.98 2.10
117 3/4" X 3/4" XS LEAD X MALE COMP COUP (M74753-67) No Bid No Bid 24.19 38.00 33.48 18.00
118  3/4" BRASS PLUG 2.68 No Bid 3.19 2.85 2.19 2.14
119 1" BRASS PLUG 3.54 No Bid 4.20 3.75 2.96 2.82
120 2" BRASS PLUGS 10.60 No Bid 12.57 9.25 8.60 8.44
121  3/4" BRASS CAPS 2.96 No Bid 3.51 2.80 2.42 2.37
122 1" BRASS CAPS 4.64 No Bid 5.50 4.25 3.79 3.51
123 2" BRASS CAPS 15.54 No Bid 19.19 14.00 13.14 12.90
124 3/4" X 1/2" BRASS BUSHINGS 2.33 No Bid 2.91 2.15 2.00 1.96
125 1" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHINGS 3.50 No Bid 4.40 3.50 3.04 2.96
126 1" X 3/4" BRASS REDUCERS 7.42 No Bid 8.80 6.75 6.02 5.92
127  3/4" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS 4.35 No Bid 5.44 4.05 3.75 3.66
128 1" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS 6.69 No Bid 8.40 6.35 5.75 5.64
129 11/2" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS 18.79 No Bid 23.20 17.25 11.42 15.60
130 2" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS 20.77 No Bid 27.14 20.00 18.40 18.24
131  3/4" BRASS 45 DEGREE ELLS 4.35 No Bid 5.44 4.25 3.72 3.66
132 1" BRASS 45 DEGREE ELLS 7.34 No Bid 9.19 6.95 6.29 6.18
133 2" BRASS 45 DEGREE ELLS 22.85 No Bid 29.86 22.00 19.99 20.08
134  3/4" BRASS TEES 5.65 No Bid 6.69 5.05 4.62 4.50
135 1" BRASSTEES 10.02 No Bid 11.87 9.00 8.06 7.99
136 2" X 3/4" BRASS TEES 37.60 No Bid 46.43 34.00 31.19 25.00
137 2" X 1" BRASSTEES 37.60 No Bid 46.43 34.00 31.19 28.37
138 2" X 2" BRASSTEES 30.44 No Bid 37.59 28.00 25.25 23.00
139 1/2" BRASS COUPLINGS 2.81 No Bid 3.33 3.00 2.29 5.15
140  3/4" BRASS COUPLINGS 3.50 No Bid 4.40 3.50 3.01 2.69
141 1" BRASS COUPLINGS 5.34 No Bid 6.69 5.00 4.59 4.09
142 11/2" BRASS COUPLINGS 11.51 No Bid 14.21 11.00 9.57 8.78
143 2" BRASS COUPLINGS 17.90 No Bid 23.39 18.00 15.51 14.44
144 2" BRASS UNION 40.56 No Bid 50.07 44.00 33.55 30.92
145  3/4" SPIGOTS, ARROWHEAD OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 15.00 11.00 8.20 8.93
146  3/4" MALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4753T OR EQUAL 15.57 No Bid 13.11 14.65 12.45 12.75
147  3/4" FEMALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4754T OR EQUAL 16.38 No Bid 13.79 15.70 16.38 13.75
148 1" MALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4753T OR EQUAL 18.44 No Bid 15.53 17.30 14.75 15.00
149 1" FEMALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4754T OR EQUAL 22.22 No Bid 18.72 22.40 25.26 18.00
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Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1
Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks

:;2‘:" Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
150  3/4" 3-PART UNIONS MCDONALD 4758T OR EQUAL 18.96 No Bid 15.97 17.85 15.17 16.00
151 1" 3-PART UNIONS MCDONALD 4758T OR EQUAL 21.69 No Bid 18.26 19.45 17.35 17.50
152 1"X 1" X 1" COPPER COMPRESSION TEES MCDONALD 4760T OR EQUAL 49.10 No Bid 40.37 57.85 38.35 40.20
153 1"X 3/4" X 3/4" U-BRANCH MCDONALD 708UQM 52.47 No Bid 33.96 42.25 44.83 88.00
154 1" X 3/4" BRASS COMPRESSION WYES MCDONALD 708YSTT OR EQUAL 39.24 No Bid 33.04 35.10 31.39 30.00
155  3/4" COMP. X M.I.P. 90 DEGREE BENDS MCDONALD 4779MT OR EQUAL 17.05 No Bid 14.36 15.25 13.64 13.65
156 1" COMP. X M.I.P. 90 DEGREE BENDS MCDONALD 4779MT OR EQUAL 28.37 No Bid 23.89 26.30 22.70 23.00
157  3/4" BRASS COMPRESSION TEES MCDONALD 4760T OR EQUAL 45.88 No Bid 37.72 41.00 35.83 40.00
158  3/4" X 6" BOLTS FOR UNIVERSAL PIPE No Bid No Bid 5.51 5.95 3.15 3.00
159  3/4"-11/4" CHINESE FINGERS GRIP (PART # 185-903) No Bid No Bid 135.71 98.00 65.99 60.00
160 112" MCDONALD BY D ENBL
161 2" MCDONALD METER BYDASS [ 24" | NG )

Schedule 9 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 1,198.28 1,086.05 907.90 905.98

Schedule 10 3” and Larger Pipe Accessories
162 6" FOSTER ADPT & ACCESS 96.78 No Bid 96.36 155.00 101.53 80.00
163 6" RUN X 4" BRANCH M. J. TEES 126.00 No Bid 119.75 156.00 113.76 141.12
164 6" RUN X 6" BRANCH M. J. TEES 136.00 No Bid 128.89 168.00 122.45 151.90
165 8" RUN X 6" BRANCH M. J. TEES 168.50 No Bid 159.66 208.00 151.68 188.16
166 8" X 6" CONCENTRIC M. J. REDUCERS 80.00 No Bid 76.09 99.00 72.29 105.84
167 6" 90 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 95.00 No Bid 89.81 117.00 85.32 105.84
168 8" 90 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 137.00 No Bid 129.73 169.00 123.24 152.88
169 4" 45 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 48.00 No Bid 45.74 60.00 43.45 53.90
170 6" 45 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 77.00 No Bid 72.77 95.00 69.13 85.75
171 6" 22 1/2 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 70.00 No Bid 66.12 86.00 62.81 77.91
172 8"221/2 DEGREE MECHANICAL JOINT BEND 109.00 No Bid 103.54 135.00 98.36 122.01
173 4" MJPLUG WITH 2" IPT TAP 50.00 No Bid 47.40 62.00 40.69 55.86
174 8" MJPLUG WITH 2" IPT TAP 98.00 No Bid 92.73 121.00 77.42 109.27
175 12" MJ CAP WITH 2" IPT TAP 151.00 No Bid 133.88 174.00 127.19 157.78
176 6" SOLID M.J. SLEEVES 86.00 No Bid 81.49 106.00 77.42 96.04
177 8" SOLID M.J. SLEEVES 138.00 No Bid 130.98 171.00 124.43 154.35
178 12" SOLID M.J. SLEEVES 222.00 No Bid 210.81 274.00 200.27 248.43
179 4" X 12" ANCHOR COUPLINGS, DUCTILE IRON 88.00 No Bid 83.16 108.00 79.00 98.00
180 6" X 12" ANCHOR COUPLINGS, DUCTILE IRON 154.00 No Bid 146.36 190.00 139.04 172.48
181 8" X 12" ANCHOR COUPLINGS, DUCTILE IRON 198.00 No Bid 187.53 244.00 178.15 220.99
182 4" RUN X 4" BRANCH FLANGED TEES 194.00 No Bid 184.20 240.00 174.99 217.07
183 4" 90 DEGREE FLANGED BEND 101.00 No Bid 101.04 132.00 95.99 119.07
184 3" 90 DEGREE FLANGED BEND 65.00 No Bid 65.28 85.00 62.02 76.93
185 3" RUN X 3" BRANCHED FLANGED TEE 98.00 No Bid 93.14 121.00 88.00 109.76
186 4" M.J. X 3" FLANGED REDUCER No Bid No Bid 85.24 91.00 82.50 81.83
187 3" MJFA-3-I FLANGE COUPLING ADAPTER No Bid No Bid 84.55 175.00 80.32 35.00
188 4" MJFA-4-| FLANGE COUPLING ADAPTER No Bid No Bid 87.01 225.00 82.66 45.00
189 6" MJFA-6-1 FLANGE COUPLING ADAPTER No Bid No Bid 128.74 275.00 122.30 55.00
190 3" X 12" FLANGE X PE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 174.82 65.00 128.00 150.61
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
:;2:: Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
191 3" x 12" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 254.15 89.00 185.00 218.95
192 3" X 24" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 357.22 125.00 256.00 307.75
193 3" X 36" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 460.29 165.00 328.00 374.52
194 4" X 12" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 222.82 85.00 165.00 216.66
195 4" X 24" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 271.33 100.00 198.00 291.48
196 4"X 48" FLANGED X FLANGED SPOOL No Bid No Bid 368.34 136.00 265.00 299.70
197 4" X 36" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 319.83 119.00 231.00 265.86
198 6" X 36" LONG FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL No Bid No Bid 398.15 148.00 285.00 235.20
199 4" UNIFLANGE 1300-C ( RESTRAINT DEVICE ) 31.60 No Bid 23.86 32.00 22.67 18.50
200 6" UNIFLANGE 1300-C ( RESTRAINT DEVICE ) 37.65 No Bid 29.31 45.00 27.84 23.00
201 8" UNIFLANGE 1300-C ( RESTRAINT DEVICE ) 66.78 No Bid 48.83 72.00 46.39 40.00
202 12" UNIFLANGE 1300-C ( RESTRAINT DEVICE ) 110.84 No Bid 87.76 115.00 83.37 80.00
203 3" FLANGE PACKS (NUTS, BOLTS, GASKETS) 6.32 No Bid 6.43 6.00 4.99 7.08
204 4" FLANGE PACK (BOLTS, NUTS, GASKET) 9.24 No Bid 9.29 7.00 6.88 9.50
205 6" FLANGE PACK (BOLTS, NUTS, GASKET) 12.35 No Bid 14.29 10.00 10.56 16.92
206 4" MJ GASKET FOR 4" NOMINAL DIAMETER FITTINGS 5.60 No Bid 4.74 6.00 4.74 20.00
207 6" MJ GASKET FOR 6" NOMINAL DIAMETER FITTINGS 5.60 No Bid 4.74 6.00 4.74 491
208 8" MJ GASKET FOR 8" NOMINAL DIAMETER FITTINGS 6.06 No Bid 5.14 7.00 5.14 6.13
209 12" MJ GASKET FOR 12" NOMINAL DIAMETER FITTINGS 9.32 No Bid 8.32 11.00 7.90 9.89
210 4"MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 38.17 No Bid 19.07 29.00 18.54 19.68
211 6" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 47.48 No Bid 22.45 35.00 21.81 23.14
212 8"MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 64.44 No Bid 33.74 53.00 32.77 34.78
213 10" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 92.07 No Bid 50.01 79.00 48.57 47.59
214 12" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 123.42 No Bid 72.85 114.00 70.77 69.33
215 16" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON 225.20 No Bid 138.00 216.00 134.06 132.02
Schedule 10 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 6,437.78 6,117.00 5,469.15 6,241.37
Schedule 11 Pipe Accessories
216  PIPE LUBRICANT - 1 QUART CONTAINERS 3.00 No Bid 5.21 5.00 3.88 3.50
217  PIPE LUBRICANT - 1 GALLON CONTAINERS 11.00 No Bid 16.60 15.00 12.50 10.00
218  JOMAR PIPE LUBRICANT (GREEN STUFF) - PINT CONTAINERS No Bid No Bid 17.11 12.00 11.56 12.00
219  WATER LINE MARKERS (6x2 1/2") CARSONITE OR EQUAL 16.95 No Bid 20.00 18.00 15.65 13.50
220 LOCATING WIRE (14 GUAGE SOLID COPPER) 0.14 No Bid 0.21 0.12 0.14 0.15
221  DUCTILE LUGS DUCTILE IRON (MEETING ASTM A536-80) 3.30 No Bid 3.93 2.35 2.80 2.97
222 3/4" ALLTHREAD ROD 22.50 No Bid 2.86 1.85 1.79 1.50
223 PROBING RODS 82.00 No Bid 87.00 79.00 69.99 62.50
Schedule 11 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 152.92 133.32 118.31 106.12
Schedule 12 Dresser Couplings
224 ;O};YMAX DRESSER COUPLING FOR 2" OR 2 1/2" COPPER (PART # 2000-0303- 106.00 No Bid 90.38 99.00 on41 105.00
225 3" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING COPPER PART# 2000-0433-260 139.50 No Bid 131.11 121.00 124.55 127.05
226 4" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING RANGE (4.25-5.63) 179.00 No Bid 168.00 169.00 159.60 102.79
227 6" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING ( O.D. 6.42-7.68 ) 237.00 No Bid 222.48 222.00 211.36 215.59
228  8"HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING ( OD 8.54-9.84 ) 268.00 No Bid 251.19 250.00 238.63 243.41
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City of
TUSCALOOSA
ACCOUNTING & FINANCEF

Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1

Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
:;2:: Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
229  1/2" BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 18.96 No Bid 16.73 29.00 15.89 18.50
230  3/4" BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 27.70 No Bid 24.44 29.00 23.22 24.00
231 1" BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 47.02 No Bid 41.48 46.00 39.41 37.50
232 11/4"BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 67.47 No Bid 59.53 95.00 56.55 52.00
233 11/2"BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 91.74 No Bid 80.94 95.00 76.89 73.00
234 2" BRASS PACK JOINT COUPLING (C77-XX-NL OR EQUAL) 138.76 No Bid 122.42 165.00 116.30 111.00
235  3/4" BRASS RANGER COUPLING (74758-11) No Bid No Bid 61.03 70.00 40.82 41.92
236 1" BRASS RANGER COUPLING (74758-11) No Bid No Bid 101.29 75.00 67.09 67.78
Schedule 12 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 1,380.02 1,465.00 1,264.72 1,219.54
Schedule 13 Repair Clamps
237 2"X 7-1/2" FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMP (F1-263-75 ) 53.70 No Bid 50.36 34.00 47.84 55.00
238 1/2" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 7.24 No Bid 6.45 4.60 6.23 6.26
239 1/2" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 13.38 No Bid 11.41 8.40 11.51 11.09
240  3/4" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 7.41 No Bid 6.74 4.50 6.40 6.56
241  3/4" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 13.81 No Bid 11.77 8.50 11.18 11.77
242 1" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 8.05 No Bid 6.86 5.00 6.52 6.86
243 1" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL (Snap) 14.71 No Bid 11.99 9.05 11.39 11.99
244 2" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP (Snap) 9.75 No Bid 9.24 6.00 8.78 9.24
245 2" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP (Snap) 17.65 No Bid 15.73 10.90 14.94 15.32
246 2" x7.50" COLLAR LEAK REPAIR CLAMP 65.05 No Bid 56.13 44.00 46.72 40.00
247 11/2"X 3" WRAP CLAMP REPAIR CLAMP ( FSC-190-3R ) 28.08 No Bid 14.89 19.20 14.15 14.51
248 11/4"X 3" WRAP CLAMP REPAIR CLAMP 27.50 No Bid 14.59 19.00 13.86 14.22
249 2"X 3" WRAP REPAIR CLAMP 30.56 No Bid 16.22 6.50 15.41 15.81
250 2"X 6" WRAP REPAIR CLAMP 56.78 No Bid 30.13 11.05 28.62 29.20
Schedule 13 Total 353.67 Does Not Qualify 262.51 190.70 243.55 247.83
Schedule 14 PVC Pipe
251 2" PVCPIPE, CLASS 200 1.19 No Bid 2.02 1.50 1.15 1.25
252 4" SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 4.47 No Bid 7.78 5.95 4.40 5.97
253 6" PVC PIPE, CLASS 200 8.03 No Bid 11.70 10.25 8.09 9.50
254 12" SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 28.52 No Bid 42.64 48.00 25.97 32.74
255 12" PVCHW SEWER PIPE 14LF 24.82 No Bid 44.32 36.00 24.90 28.57
Schedule 14 Total 67.03 Does Not Qualify 108.46 101.70 64.51 78.03
Schedule 15 Sewer Pipe Accessories & Related Items
256 4" CLAY TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING 33.18 No Bid 17.95 19.00 24.26 4.30
257 6" CLAY TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING 50.90 No Bid 29.93 28.00 40.97 9.20
258 4" PVCTO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING 22.64 No Bid 11.96 12.00 16.63 4.30
259 8"PVCTO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING 64.00 No Bid 34.53 34.00 46.57 14.16
260  SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE MARKERS (WHITE) No Bid No Bid 20.00 28.00 15.55 15.00
261  FULL RANGE 3M MARKER WASTE WATER No Bid No Bid 26.43 24.00 19.99 12.50
262 4" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF 2.83 No Bid 4.92 4.15 2.88 3.64
263 6" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF 6.30 No Bid 10.96 9.15 6.21 7.93
264 8" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF 11.10 No Bid 19.82 16.50 11.21 13.27

Purchasing Division

7 of 10



y > 4

City of
TUSCALOOSA
ACCOUNTING & FINANCEF

Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1

Issue Date: 07/28/21
Open Date: 08/30/21

Preliminary Bid Tabulation G&C Supply Co Inc Core & Viain| P Empire Pipe Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks
:;2:: Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
265 10" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF 17.29 No Bid 30.88 27.00 17.42 20.59
266 4" PVC HW SEWER SXG ST 22 DEG BEND No Bid No Bid 29.49 19.00 8.98 17.59
267 8" CL-350 DI PERMOX LINED No Bid No Bid 47.36 43.00 43.92 46.51
268 10" CL-350 PERMOX LINED DI PIPE No Bid No Bid 56.86 52.00 53.40 55.94
269 16" DI PIPE W/PERMOX LINING No Bid No Bid 94.31 92.00 100.32 103.49
270 TIGER TAIL3"x 36" No Bid No Bid 115.71 125.00 59.98 81.00
271 2" SEWER AIR RELEASE VALVE (ARV) APCO MN:402WA.1 No Bid No Bid 1,571.43 1,150.00 1,149.00 1,500.00
272 2" SEWER ARV (CRISPIN MN: SL20) W/BACKFLUSH VALVE No Bid No Bid 1,392.86 1,150.00 967.00 1,050.00
273 2" STAINLESS ARV (CRISPIN - UX, D434G00UX20) No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 2,950.00 1,920.00 2,080.00
274 4" GRIPPER PLUG (WING NUT) 7.04 No Bid 28.93 10.00 23.99 5.67
275 4" PVCSEWER SOLVENT WELD END CAP (SDR-35) 2.26 No Bid 2.23 2.25 1.89 1.81
276  WATER PLUG (50 LB PAILS) 32.00 No Bid 36.43 29.00 28.00 40.00
277 16" MJ SOLID SLEEVE PERMOX LINED No Bid No Bid 656.35 1,425.00 634.00 661.20
Schedule 15 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 7,239.34 7,249.05 5,192.17 5,748.10
Schedule 16 Tap Sleeves & Saddles
278 2" X 3/4" BRONZE SADDLES, CC THREAD FOR PVC PIPE ( MCDONALD 3892) 21.20 25.00 19.21 31.37 18.25 21.56
279 2" X 1"BRONZE SADDLES, CC THREAD FOR PVC PIPE ( MCDONALD 3892) 21.20 25.00 19.21 31.37 18.25 21.56
280 3"X 3/4"BRONZE TAP SADDLE FOR PVC 27.96 55.00 25.35 41.40 24.08 28.50
281 4" X 2" TAP SADDLES, |.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP FOR C.I. 4.76 - 5.26 72.23 40.00 31.68 35.00 30.49 26.23
282 6" X 1"TAP SADDLES, CC THREAD, DOUBLE STRAP PVC 6.63 - 6.90 75.88 No Bid 26.54 33.35 25.21 32.35
283 6" X2"TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR DI 6.84 - 7.60 81.88 43.00 33.87 41.10 35.87 40.00
284 8" X2"TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE 8.99 - 9.79 93.56 53.00 41.34 45.40 40.22 45.00
285 12" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE 122.98 84.00 65.67 71.80 63.16 70.00
286 16" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE 153.42 No Bid 91.08 124.10 86.53 100.00
287 6" X6"SSTAP SLEEVE (JCM #432 OR EQUAL)(OD 7.05 -7.40) No Bid No Bid 429.22 578.00 407.76 550.00
288 6"X 6"SS TAP SLEEVE DI (JCM #432 OR EQUAL)(O.D. 6.83-7.16) No Bid No Bid 429.22 578.00 407.76 550.00
289  8"X8"SSTAPSLEEVE (JCM #432 OR EQUAL) (OD 8.98-9.37) No Bid No Bid 538.95 805.00 512.00 900.00
290 12" X 8" TAP SLEEVE (AMERICAN #AFC-2800 OR EQUAL) No Bid No Bid 1,815.61 2,280.00 2,076.00 1,700.00
Schedule 16 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 3,566.95 4,695.89 3,745.58 4,085.20
Schedule 17 Valves & Accessories
291 2" STOCKHAM B103 GATE VALVES OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 41.31 129.00 178.03 40.00
292 2" RS THREADED GATE VALVE 289.00 No Bid 251.78 250.00 243.25 237.18
293 4" TAPPING VALVES (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 534.00 545.00 393.88 516.00 494.46 489.85
294 6" TAPPING VALVES (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 754.00 770.00 526.47 729.00 698.48 691.63
295 8" TAPPING VALVES (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 1,120.00 1,140.00 822.68 1,081.00 1,036.83 1,020.85
296 4" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 423.00 413.00 412.58 410.00 388.73 388.52
297 6" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 540.00 530.00 526.47 522.00 437.05 496.05
298 8" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 860.00 840.00 838.56 831.00 798.07 789.42
299 3" GATE VALVES (FLANGED) (AMERICAN 865 RS OR EQUAL) 420.00 370.00 366.03 363.00 347.73 344.71
300 4" GATE VALVES (FLANGED) (AMERICAN 2500 RS OR EQUAL) 470.00 410.00 409.05 406.00 388.60 384.98
301  3/4" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 83.79 61.10 58.65 62.50
302 1" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 101.29 74.00 70.90 72.72
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Various Infrastructure Supplies - Bid No. 9070-083021-1
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- . . I In Consolidated Pipe Southern Pipe Ferguson
Preliminary Bid Tabulation e an’)p v Co. ¢ Core & Main LP Empire Pipe ¥ 2 4
(conditional bid) & Supply & Supply Waterworks

II;:‘:\ Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

303 11/2" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 346.64 253.00 242.65 245.10

304 2" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 488.71 358.00 342.10 360.11

305 2" VALVE BOX RISERS FOR 7" VALVE BOX No Bid No Bid 23.57 29.00 31.10 16.09

306 2" STOCKHAM B-319 CHECK VALVE OR EQUAL No Bid No Bid 36.61 155.00 51.50 38.57

307 VALVE BOX, 18" X 24" SCREW TYPE W/LID (5-1/4" DIA.) 37.50 No Bid 72.26 36.00 44,13 35.00

308 1"ADAPTERS FOR 5 1/4" VALVE BOXES 19.95 No Bid 12.07 12.00 23.55 7.94

309 11/2" ADAPTERS FOR 5 1/4" VALVE BOXES 26.00 No Bid 13.93 15.00 30.55 11.92

310 6"X 51/4"VALVE BOX RISER 52.00 No Bid 34.36 24.00 62.50 51.64

311 51/4" VALVE BOX WATER LID ONLY 13.00 No Bid 13.60 15.00 12.55 12.58
Schedule 17 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify 5,815.64 6,269.10 5,981.41 5,797.36
Schedule 18 New Meter Reading Products

312 ENCODER WITH INTEGRAL CONNECTOR AND LEAK SENSOR ERW-1300-403 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

313 100W THROUGH THE LID MOUNT KIT CFG-1300-004 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

314 THROUGH THE LID REMOTE MOUNT ANTENNA KIT CFG-0900-003 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

315  ITRON SPLICE KIT OEM-0034-002 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

" CABLE WITH IN-LINE CONNECTOR WITH .167" PROTECTIVE COVER CFG-0151-

316 (5)13 €0 cTo 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 18 Total Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify Does Not Qualify
Schedule 19 Locating Products

317  BLUE INVERTED MARKING PAINT (KRYLON INDUSTRIAL QUIK MARK) 3.95 No Bid 9.50 3.95 3.12 2.85

318  GREEN INVERTED MARKING PAINT (KRYLON INDUSTRIAL QUIK MARK) 3.95 No Bid 9.50 3.95 3.12 2.85

319 WHITE INVERTED MARKING PAINT (KRYLON INDUSTRIAL QUIK MARK) 3.95 No Bid 9.50 3.95 3.12 2.85

320  RED INVERTED MARKING PAINT (KRYLON INDUSTRIAL QUIK MARK) 3.95 No Bid 9.50 3.95 3.12 2.85

321  ORANGE INVERTED MARKING PAINT (KRYLON INDUSTRIAL QUIK MARK) 3.95 No Bid 9.50 3.95 3.12 2.85
Schedule 19 Total 19.75 Does Not Qualify 47.50 19.75 15.60 14.25
Schedule 20 11/2” and 2” No-Rise Meter Setter Bypass

322 17" NO-RISE METER SETTER BYPASS 966.00 No Bid 1,149.27 No Bid 974.95 815.00

323 2” NO-RISE METER SETTER BYPASS 1,082.00 No Bid 1,026.26 No Bid 1,091.81 1,050.00
Schedule 20 Total 2,048.00 Does Not Qualify 2,175.53 Does Not Qualify 2,066.76 1,865.00
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Cell: H6
Comment: Amanda Gann:
Both bid and addendum are stamped with "DUE TO THE UNSTABLE MARKET AND FLUCTUATING MANUFACTURING COST, YOUR PRICE MAY BE SUBJEC TO CHANGE CALL 1-800-238-3836 TO CONFIRM PRICE"

Cell: L331

Comment: Amanda Gann:
Clerical Error on this item from vendor. Received letter from vendor to update from 633.33 to 2076.00
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